
By REBECCA MORIN
rebecca-morin@uiowa.edu

WASHINGTON, Iowa — 
After nearly 18 hours of 
deliberating on April 30, 
the Democratic District 
Convention for the 2nd 
Congressional District 
ended with an equal split 
of the eight national dele-
gates, four for Sen. Bernie 
Sanders and four for Hil-
lary Clinton.

The big win for Sanders’s 
supporters that night, how-
ever, was not the number of 
delegates going to the na-
tional convention, but new 
rules and representation 
that were passed with the 
ideals Sanders’ campaign 
has run on.

A goal to reach $15 min-
imum wage and to oppose 
superdelegates were both 
passed — points that have 
been a main part of Sand-
ers’s campaign.

Both had several re-
counts but were eventual-
ly passed. Similar planks, 
or fundamental goals for 

the party, were deliberat-
ed in other districts, but 
did not pass.

Sanders’ supporters had 
191 delegates coming in-
to the district convention 
who were nominated at 
the county convention on 
March 12. Clinton had 180 
delegates going in. There 
are 15 Clinton delegates 
and 14 Sanders delegates 
going to the Democratic 
National Convention in 
Philadelphia on July 25-
28, according to results 
from all four Iowa Con-
gressional Districts.

Daniel Clark, a 25-year-
old from Mount Pleasant, 
Iowa, was voted by Sand-
ers’s delegates to represent 
them at the national event. 

As one of 18 vying for the 
two male delegate seats, 
Clark said he stands with 
Sanders because of the 
support the Vermont sen-
ator has given the LGBTQ 
community. Clark, who 
said he was part of the 
LGBTQ community, is go-
ing to stay with Sanders 

throughout the whole con-
vention, and he will not 
switch to Clinton.

During his testimony be-
fore the other Sanders’ dele-
gates, Clark said he had the 
opportunity to meet Sand-
ers and asked why LGBTQ 
issues were important to 
him. Sanders replied it’s 
part of being a decent hu-

man being, Clark said.
“I believe I will stand by 

the person who has been 
standing by me and that’s 
where I want to be,” he 
said. “I don’t feel like any-
one else is worthy of my 
vote this time around, and 
I will stick to my gut about 

By GAGE MISKIMEN
gage-miskimen@uiowa.edu

Johnson County’s minimum wage 
is now the highest in the state.

The second phase of the county’s 
minimum-wage ordinance went 
into effect on Sunday, raising the 
minimum wage to $9.15 an hour.

Johnson County 
Supervisor Mike Car-
berry said the sec-
ond phase will have 
more of an effect on 
the county than the 
first one did when 
it was implemented 
in November 2015, 
when the wage was 
increased from $7.25 
to $8.20.

“During the first phase, most of 
the jobs in Iowa City were already 
paying that $8.20 amount at least 
or more, because of the city’s tight 
labor market,” he said. “There 
weren’t a lot of people working for 
$7.25. The second increase will pos-
sibly have more impact, because 
we’re getting close to what the low-
wage workers are being paid.”

Carberry said there are more peo-
ple in the county working in the $8-
$9 range than there were working 
for $7.25.

“Those people will get a raise 
now,” he said. “If you’ve seen the 
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Local 
minimum 
wage rises

By GRACEY MURPHY
gracey-murphy@uiowa.edu

New plays, fresh actors, and a whole 
lot of drama can only mean it’s time 
for the theater event of the year: the 
Iowa New Play Festival.

Each year, during the last week of 
school, the Theater 
Department puts on a 
week full of new plays 
worked on by stu-
dents. This year, today 
through Wednesday, 
the will have two full 
productions, squeeze: A 
Motel Play today and 
Cut & Run on Tues-
day. Additionally, there 
will be a reading given daily: Packing, 
Quiz Out, and Household or Must be 
a Duck.

“We don’t have time to think, so 
you don’t have time to doubt yourself, 
you don’t have time to get all in your 
head.,” said Ariel Francouer, the direc-
tor of squeeze. “We have to put this up, 
we have to help other people do their 
jobs, and it becomes very selfless. I 
think it’s representative of what the-
ater is. Theater is so ephemeral. You 
enter the show as an audience mem-
ber, and that specific show will never 
happen again.” 

This is Francouer’s third time di-
recting a play for the festival, but it is 
playwright Theresa Giacopasi’s first 

New Play 
Fest opens 
in motel

Sanders, Clinton split delegates

SEE FESTIVAL, 2SEE DEMOCRATS, 2

Francouer
director

Balloons that spell “Hillary” were displayed in a gym at Washington High School in Washington, 
Iowa, for the Democratic District Convention for the 2nd Congressional District on April 30. (The 
Daily Iowan/Rebecca Morin)
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By TOM ACKERMAN  |  thomas-ackerman@uiowa.edu

The University of Iowa Hospitals and Clinics is expe-
riencing a spike in patient growth, and 200 jobs are 
potentially being offered Friday.  

UI officials said the Children’s Hospital will open this 
summer and some growth is expected, though patients 
are arriving in larger numbers than predicted — with 
inpatients currently occupying more than 88 percent of 
the capacity and climbing. 

Sara Caven, a UIHC program director, said the move to 

recruit more workers is also due to the increasing numbers 
of sick people, though officials are not sure why.

Although officials are unsure how to specifically assess 
the unforeseen growth, Rebecca Schwertfeger, a Human 
Resources official who assesses hospital-wide recruitment 
needs, said statewide insurance changes may allow more 
people to get more health-care services than before. 

“In a hospital, you never want to say your beds are full,” 
she said. “It’s a good thing to see the growth, but it isn’t 

Carberry
supervisor

UIHC tosses job net

The exterior of the University of Iowa Children Hospital is seen on Sunday. The hospital is expected to be completed this summer, helping to bring many jobs to the local area. (The Daily Iowan/Margaret Kispert)

SEE UIHC, 2



show in the event. She en-
joyed that she was able to 
work with a variety of peo-
ple, she said. With the pro-
duction, she gets to work 
with set designers, costume 
designers, and many others. 
She’s had readings in the 
past, but never one of the 
full-scale productions. 

The play is about four 
very distinct women who 
go to a motel, ultimately 
becoming trapped there. 

“I stay in too many bad 
motel rooms,” Giacopasi 
said. “I’m one of those peo-
ple that get in at 11 p.m. 
and leaves at 7 a.m., but 
there is a different kind of 

person who stays in a mo-
tel for a very long period of 
time. It’s a very masculine 
space, so I started thinking 
about where the women 
stay here.”

She also drew inspiration 
from programs that host in-
ternational students as in-
terns, she said. They might 
say that the student will 
be in NYC, when actually 
they’re working at a motel 
an hour outside of it with 
no means of transportation. 
They’re isolated all sum-
mer, with no one other than 
the people who check in. 

The other play, Cut & 
Run, will be performed on 
Tuesday. The playwright, 
Eric Micha Holmes, cre-
ated this play after living 
in NYC for an extended 
amount of time. He was a 

concierge at a hotel and 
was introduced to many 
strata of society, he said. 
He could be on the phone 
speaking with a C-list 
celeb requesting drugs 
while also watching a taxi 
driver’s car.

While there, he came 
across an article about Ra-
bia Sarwar, a woman from 
Pakistan who married an 
American-Pakistani man. 
She didn’t appreciate his 
neglect toward Islamic val-
ues, so she tried to slit his 
throat while he slept. 

“From the moment I read 
it, for some bizarre reason, 
I understood her,” Holmes 
said. “Living in New York 
City, she became this char-
acter through whom I could 
vent my own frustrations 
about living there.”

For Sydney Alexander 
(Gretchen/Vixie in Cut & 
Run) this will be her first 
time participating in the 
festival.

“My biggest goal is 
keeping my energy up,” 
Alexander said. “It’s on-
ly one day, so we only 
have one shot. I’ve never 
worked with such a small 
cast. I’ve loved getting a 
cohesive bond among peo-
ple I work with.” 

For the New Play Fes-
tival, these shows are 
just the beginning; the 
festival will continue 
through Friday.

“People should come be-
cause it’s nice to come to 
the West Side of the river 
for something besides foot-
ball or going to the hospi-
tal,” Holmes said.

what we were expecting.”
She said areas of hir-

ing in the job fair include 
nursing, respiratory ther-
apy, operating rooms, 
documentation/coding, 
hospitalists, and ad-
vanced-practice providers.

Caven said that since 
the New Year, more than 
500 people in nursing 
have been hired and 
close to 700 positions 
have been filled, which 
includes UIHC employ-
ees transferring to the 
department. Additional-
ly, 136.5 full-time equiva-
lent new staff nurse posi-
tions have been hired. 

She noted that there are 

currently around 3,500 
employees in nursing. 

Caven believes the 
growth is occurring as a 
result of UIHC’s reputa-
tion as a leading health-
care employer, as well as 
more focus being placed 
on the organization as 
the Children’s Hospital 
prepares to open soon. 

“It feels like we started 
to really pick up the pace 
in recruitment since Jan-
uary of 2015,” she said. 
“Since then, we’ve con-
tinued to recruit.” 

Caven is eager to hire 
at the fair because she 
feels the hiring process 
can become muddled in 
a large organization. She 
said the fair will be a 
positive way to reach out 
to the community. 

“Because it’s such a big 

and complex organiza-
tion, members of our own 
community struggle to 
navigate in the process,” 
she said. “We found this 
as opportunity to help 
people with this.”

UI undergraduate stu-
dent Camille Krall, who 
interns at patient-finan-
cial services helping to 
determine whether appli-
cants to the department 
meet certain qualifica-
tions, hopes to find a job 
at UIHC when she grad-
uates. But she said most 
employees come from 
other hospitals rather 
than the university. 

“It really just boils 
down to looking at the job 
descriptions,” she said. 
“Unfortunately, we have 
to be pretty picky about 
whom we bring in. We 

can get 80 applications 
for a job.” 

She noted that many 
students do not apply to 
UIHC as a first job as a 
result of the competition.

Krall feels her intern-
ships have been more 
beneficial than entry-lev-
el career opportunities, 
though she hopes to see 
more available in the 
future. As an intern, 
she said, her eyes were 
opened to the extent of 
growth as applications 
have been coming in. 

Krall will attend the 
fair as an intern, and 
she is excited about the 
opportunity to hire pro-
spective students. 

The fair will take place 
Friday at the University 
Capitol Center from 9 
a.m. to 4 p.m.

that.”
Sanders supporters also 

had a victory when it came 
to adding a supporter to the 
State Central Committee.

Recent Sanders staffer 
Kate Reveaux ran to be one 
of two women being added 

to the committee.
Reveaux, who is from 

Johnson County, said in 
her testimony that work-
ing for the Sanders cam-
paign has inspired her to 
continue his message in 
the Democratic Party.

In addition, a Sanders 
delegate was also elected 
as a presidential elector — 
or the Electoral College. 

University of Iowa junior 

Nick Kruse was elected by 
both Clinton and Sand-
ers delegates to be on the 
Electoral College. Kruse 
said unlike some of the 
other Sanders delegates, 
he is not “Bernie or Bust” 
— meaning he will vote for 
someone other than Sand-
ers if he is not the nominee.

Of the candidates run-
ning for the presidential 
elector, several Sanders’ 

delegates openly said they 
were “Bernie or Bust.” 
Kruse said he ran because 
he was concerned with 
hearing other candidates 
say that and wanted to try 
to stop them.

“I'm doing this to inspire 
young people,” Kruse said. 
“I have been a Bernie since 
Day 1, but I know ‘Bernie 
or Bust’ is not the way to go 
about this.”

stats from the Iowa Poli-
cy Project, it takes about 
$13.00 for a single per-
son with no kids to get 
above poverty wages. So 
this second phase will 
have a little more impact 
and help more people get 
raises.”

He also said the in-
crease in wages may 
cause people in smaller 
towns with lower wages 
to try to find work clos-
er to Iowa City or other 
areas that are following 
the Johnson County ordi-
nance.

“We might see some 
people shifting jobs in 
towns that proactively 
lowered their minimum 
wage,” he said. “If you’re 
living in Solon and you’re 
being paid $7.25 and you 
can drive to Iowa City 
and make $2 more, is 
that worth the drive? For 
some people, it could be. 
The small-town jobs may 
have a harder time com-
peting to fill those jobs.”

To help study the ef-
fects of the ordinance 
and communicate with 
people in the community, 
the Board of Supervisors 
put together a Minimum 
Wage Advisory Commit-
tee to keep track of the 

data and gather feedback 
from business owners.

Rebecca Neades, a 
member of the Minimum 
Wage Advisory Commit-
tee who is also on the 
Iowa City Chamber of 
Commerce, said the com-
mittee has members on 
both sides of the issue, 
and their job is to make 
recommendations on 
the direction the county 
should go.

“My goal is to share 
the business communi-
ty’s perspective with the 
county on how the wage 
affects the businesses,” 
she said. “Initially, we 
need to review the data 
that are out there, both 
locally and nationally, 

and have conversations 
with the community.”

UI economics Profes-
sor John Solow, another 
member of the commit-
tee, said his willingness 
to take part is because he 
is an economist.

He said he would like 
to be able to report back 
to the county and super-
visors if the ordinance is 
or isn’t working well in 
specific ways. Depend-
ing on his findings, he 
would hope to help the 
come up with solutions.

“I’m simply here to 
provide info, not to ad-
vocate for a side,” he 
said. “I want to bring 
economic thinking to 
the question.”

UIHC
CONTINUED FROM FRONT
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Soggy Hawks look ahead to turn season around
By JAKE MOSBACH
jacob-mosbach@uiowa.edu

After dropping the 
weekend series finale to 
Kansas State on Sunday 
afternoon, Hawkeye se-
nior shortstop Nick Ro-
scetti stood in the bowels 
of Banks Field, soaked 
from an afternoon of 
steady rain.

With the loss, Roscet-
ti’s Hawkeyes fell to 20-
21. After the stellar 2015 
campaign, the sub-.500 
record looks disappoint-
ing. Roscetti said, howev-
er, it’s not panic time quite 
yet for the Hawkeyes.

“We know we have 
to improve,” he said af-
ter the 4-2 loss. “We’re 
going to keep with our 
approach. Hopefully, it 
works out, but we know 
we’ve got to start win-
ning some ball games.”

The Hawks currently 
sit 10th in the Big Ten 
standings, ahead of on-
ly Rutgers, Northwest-
ern, and Purdue. The 7-8 
conference mark has a 
chance to be improved 

this weekend as the team 
travels to Ohio State for 
a three-game series.

For the time being, the 
record isn’t concerning. Se-
nior outfielder Joel Booker 
said he and the Hawkeyes 
are still capable of turning 
the season around. 

“If you panic, that’s 
when things go wrong,” 
Booker said. “Everyone’s 
calm, and we’re just tak-
ing it day by day. We’re go-
ing up there and taking it 
pitch-by-pitch and capital-
izing on mistakes. I don’t 
think there’s any panic.”

Through 41 games last 
season, the team was 30-
11. The losses of Jake 
Mangler, Blake Hick-
man, Nick Day, and oth-
ers have loomed large so 
far this season, but head 
coach Rick Heller hasn’t 
lost faith.

But that’s not to say 
Heller doesn’t see some 
areas of concern, specif-
ically at the plate. The 
Hawkeyes managed just 
6 runs in the weekend se-
ries against the Wildcats.

“When you’re not get-

ting a quality at-bat 
with runners in scoring 
position, that’s always 
concerning,” Heller said. 
“We try really hard not 
to do that, so when it 
happens, you wonder if 
you’re getting through 
to them.”

The Hawks are getting 
hits; that’s not the prob-
lem. However, once the 
team has base runners, 
the struggle to score 
them has plagued the 
team recently. Heller be-
lieves that’s an easy fix: 
Just find a way to move 
runners over, any way 
you can. 

“When you get your 
pitch, you’ve got to find a 
way to hammer it,” Hell-
er said. “We’ve just been 
off, especially the guys at 
the bottom [of the bat-
ting order].”

Looking ahead, the 
team has nine Big Ten 
contests remaining. The 
trio of three-game series 
represents an opportuni-
ty for the team to drasti-
cally improve its confer-
ence standing. 

After Ohio State on 
Friday, Saturday, and 
May 8, the team will host 
current Big Ten leader 
Michigan State from May 
13-15, then will travel to 
Penn State May 19-21.

Finding a way to earn 

series victories has to be 
the top priority for Hell-
er and the Hawkeyes. 
In the mean time the 
coach knows that with 
the team’s cool and calm 
demeanor, the sky isn’t 
falling just yet.

“We’ve just got to 
improve, and I know 
they’re capable,” Heller 
said. “We’ll bounce back 
and hopefully, have a 
good week, and we’ll get 
ready to go to Ohio State 
this weekend.”

Iowa shortstop Nick Roscetti swings the bat during the third game of the Iowa-Kansas State series at Banks field on Sunday. 
Roscetti drove in the only 2 Hawkeye runs in a 4-2 defeat. (The Daily Iowan/Margaret Kispert)

Softball stumbles into 3 losses, last place in Big Ten
By COURTNEY BAUMANN
courtney-baumann@uiowa.edu

After the Iowa softball 
team lost its last game 
in a three-game week-
end series at Illinois, the 
Hawks’ hopes to make 
the Big Ten Tournament 
are next to nada.

Iowa sits dead last in 
the Big Ten standings, 
behind Maryland by a 
half-game. Michigan 
State is in place to be the 
No. 12 seed.

The only chance Iowa 
has of making the tour-
n a m e n t 
is if the 
Hawkeyes 
win all 
t h r e e 
games over 
M i n n e -
sota this 
w e e k e n d 
and the 
S p a r t a n s 
lose all 
of theirs. Even then, it 
would come down to a 

tiebreaker for the last 
seed in the tournament.

Iowa and Illinois 
played a double-head-
er April 29, with Illi-
nois winning the both 
games, 5-1. The Illini 
then blanked Iowa in the 
third, 8-0 in five innings.

Shayla Starkenburg 
and Elizabeth Wiegand 
took the losses for the 
Hawkeyes in the first 
two games. Starkenburg 
gave up all 5 runs, on-
ly 2 earned. Wiegand 

also gave up 5 runs, 
4 earned. Illinois ju-
nior Breanna Wonderly 
pitched two complete 
games, winning both.

Iowa struggled with er-
rors, registering 2 in the 
first and 3 in the second, 
but those seemed mi-
nuscule to what haunted 
the Hawkeyes in the last 
game. The Hawks com-
mitted 8 errors in the last 
game of the series.

Starkenburg pitched 

only two-thirds of the 
first inning in the fi-
nal game. She allowed 6 
runs, 4 earned, on 3 hits, 
3 walks, and 3 errors.

The Hawks had merely 
14 hits during the three 
games, with Kaitlyn 
Mullarkey leading Iowa 
offensively. The junior 
had the only run in the 
first game, had 2 hits for 
the team in the second, 
and had 1 of just 2 hits 
for Iowa in the third.

Iowa will finish its 
regular season this 
week when it travels to 
Iowa State on Tuesday 
and rounds out Big Ten 
competition with a vis-
it from Minnesota for a 
three-game series Friday 
through May 8.

Follow @cbomb12 on 
Twitter for Iowa soft-
ball news, analysis, and 
updates.

The Hawkeyes put a huge crimp in their tournament hopes during a weekend series at Illinois.

Starkenburg
junior
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The state Board of Regents is expected to faith-
fully oversee the state of Iowa’s three public 
universities (the University of Iowa, the Uni-

versity of Northern Iowa, and Iowa State University). 
In an ideal world, this nine-person board would fur-
ther the academic excellence of our universities, find 
efficient ways to keep costs down, and remain trans-
parent in any and all necessary dealings. It’s becoming 
increasingly clear that, with our current regents, this 
ideal is a fantasy.

On April 30, Regent Mary Andringa resigned, just 
one year into a six-year term. According to the Asso-
ciated Press, Andringa said she underestimated the 
amount of time it would take to serve as a regent. 

However, the announcement of Andringa’s sudden 
departure came the day after allegations of favorit-
ism and conflicts of interest surfaced. Andringa, the 
CEO of Vermeer Corp., is also on the board of furniture 
manufacturer Herman Miller of Michigan, but she did 
not list her affiliation with the company on the regents’ 
required conflict-of-interest form when Gov. Terry 
Branstad appointed her last year. 

Records obtained by AP show that the University of 
Iowa agreed to a no-bid contract with a local Herman 
Miller distributor, Pigott, on June 30, 2015, nearly 
two months after Andringa joined the regents. On 
July 6, 2015, Andringa updated her conflict-of-inter-
est form to include her position with Herman Miller, 
according to AP. 

The contract, worth millions, was advertised by the 
UI as “maximizing the UI’s buying power” and claimed 
the UIHC “save[d] big” through the furniture-pur-
chasing deal, which had been renegotiated from a 2011 

agreement with Pigott. Normally, the UI is required 
by law to seek bids for contracts worth more than 
$25,000. But since the original contract allowed for an 
extension, the UI didn’t seek other bids five years later. 

However, the notion that awarding a contract to a 
bidder without allowing competition is “maximizing 
the UI’s buying power” doesn’t hold water. Whether or 
not Andringa’s position as a director of Herman Miller 
influenced the process of selecting a furniture distrib-
utor, it still reinforces the image of the regents (and, by 
extension, the UI) as an institution that conducts its 
business behind closed doors. At worst, deals such as 
this make our governing bodies and universities reek 
of cronyism, favoritism, and corruption, especially giv-
en past no-bid contracts that were conducted under 
similar circumstances. 

In December, the AP revealed the UI had paid a 
company $322,000 to conduct polling on the universi-
ty’s image. This, too, was tied to a previous contract: a 
2013 deal awarded to Matt Strawn, a former Iowa GOP 
chairman. The problem? The UI paid Strawn $24,900, 
an insultingly arbitrary amount that seems entirely 
based on avoiding the $25,000 minimum that would 
trigger a bidding process.

The regents have said they plan to discuss the is-
sue of no-bid contracts at their meeting in June. Giv-
en these recent events, it’s a discussion that’s overdue. 
Skirting state law and avoiding competition gives the 
appearance of corruption, and this perception reflects 
poorly on the UI. The Daily Iowan Editorial Board urg-
es the regents to change their policies on no-bid con-
tracts if they actually care about efficient spending at 
the universities they’ve been entrusted to oversee.
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Regents must change 
policies on no-bid contracts

COLUMN

Despite endless specu-
lation on who will be the 
next president, the truth is 
analysts and strategist can 
do little more than make 
educated guesses. Former 
Secretary of State Hillary 
Clinton may appear the 
front-runner now, but past 
elections show just how 
quickly things can change. 

As these candidates 
spend millions of dollars, 
work countless hours, and 
subject themselves to an 
enormous intrusion of 
their privacy in an effort 
to reach the White House, 
the rest of us wonder if the 
reward is worth the trib-
ulation. It seems winning 
simply leads to a reward of 
more misery because half 
the country is most likely 
going to despise the person 
regardless of her or his ac-
tions. Though the reasons 
that compel individuals to 
pursue the job of president 
transcends most people’s 
understanding, the next 
president’s job will likely 
be especially miserable.

In January 2017, a new 
president will walk into 
the Oval Office and barely 
have a moment to savor 
the sacred ground where 
our country’s greatest 
men made some of the 
world’s most difficult deci-
sions before being assault-
ed with the hardships 
that face our country. The 
next president will have 
to find a way to destroy 
ISIS, a terrorist group 
that controls a swath of 
land in the Middle East. 
Its terror has flooded into 
Europe and created one of 
the largest humanitarian 
crises of the last century 
as millions of refugees flee 
Syria and Iraq.

Resolving to defeat and 
destroy ISIS, especially 
with the bitter taste still 
lingering from our coun-
try’s previous Middle East 

endeavors, will be no small 
feat. Yet, this is a challenge 
that must be taken on in 
order to keep America and 
the rest of the world safe.

The 45th president 
will also face an economy 
growing at an anemic rate 
and a national debt that 
has skyrocketed in recent 
years. Despite his best ef-
forts, President Obama’s 
economic policies have 
been unproductive, and 
if the U.S. does not hit 3 
percent GDP growth this 
year, Obama will have 
overseen a presidency 
with the fourth worst GDP 
growth in history. Unfor-
tunately, the year is not off 
to a good start as annual-
ized first-quarter growth 
was only 0.5 percent. The 
next president will have 
to find a way to stimulate 
the economy without con-
stricting future growth 
by piling onto the ever- 
mounting national debt.

Finally, the next pres-
ident will walk into the 
White House under one of 
the most divisive moments 
in recent American history. 
Politically,  Congress has 
often been gridlocked as 
lawmakers have failed to 
create bills with biparti-
san support. It seems both 
parties have dug into more 
extreme positions and re-
fuse to budge. America is 
also facing increased ra-
cial tensions with the rise 
of the Black Lives Matter 
movement. There is grow-
ing despair about income 
inequality, and states are 
making laws that seem 
discriminatory to many 
Americans. Our next presi-
dent will have to find a way 
to help us overcome our 
differences and come back 
together as a nation.

Polls regularly find that 
more than 70 percent of 
Americans believe our 
country is headed in the 
wrong direction. The is-
sues raised in this article 
are just a few of the pes-
tilence that plague our 
country. While most will 
never understand why 
someone would subject 
herself or himself to the 
presidency, this time, it 
seems especially baffling.

Whenever things seem 
to be going bad in the 
world, people flock to the 
movie theaters to forget 
about the troubles of their 
real lives. During this 
time, the market for com-
edies is unusually large, 
just because of the sim-
ple reason that everyone 
needs to laugh to keep 
from crying. But when 
must a line be drawn? At 
what expense do laughs 
come from?

“Saturday Night Live” 
alumnus and all-around 
funny guy Will Ferrell 
may have just crossed 
that line. Last week, it 

was announced that Fer-
rell was to portray former 
President Ronald Reagan 
in a comedy. In this com-
edy, Ferrell would take 
on the role of the famous 
conservative during his 
second term, as dementia 
began to have an effect 
on his mental faculties. 
The plot of the film has, as 
reported by CNN, has “a 
White House intern who 
must persuade a demen-
tia-stricken Reagan that 
he’s an actor playing the 
president in a movie.”

Given that Reagan died 
in 2004 due to complica-
tions with Alzheimer’s, 
it is needless to say that 
this did not go over well. 
The backlash against this 
plot has been so great 
that Ferrell dropped out 
of the project.

Should he have, though?
Ferrell is no stranger to 

political satire. During his 
stint on “Saturday Night 
Live,” he portrayed both 

former Attorney General 
Janet Reno and former 
President George W. Bush 
with rave reviews. And 
let’s be honest, people 
liked them because they 
poked fun and highlight-
ed the eccentricities of the 
two. Translation: He made 
fun of them, and he made 
fun of them well.

So, what separates the 
situation with Reagan 
with that of Reno and 
Bush? Why are some 
people OK to satirize, 
but other figures are 
strictly off limits?

I think part of this has 
to do with simply how se-
rious people take disease, 
both of the mind and body. 
Let’s do some replace-
ments. What if someone 
made a comedy, poking 
light at AIDS or leukemia, 
I’m sure a lot of advocacy 
groups wouldn’t laugh. In 
fact, I’m sure that it would 
lead a lot of people who 
have suffered through 

said diseases (or seen 
someone suffer through 
them) to feel exploited in 
some way.

So, I can understand 
why people are offended. 
However, I think that the 
project has every right to 
do what it is doing.

Do I find it in poor taste? 
Yes, especially since I have 
heard stories of a personal 
family friend dealing with 
dementia. It is in very 
poor taste. But as much as 
I may dislike it, I respect 
the sanctity of free speech 
too much to actively try to 
advocate against a movie 
that is most likely on par 
with Seth Rogen’s The 
Interview. If people really 
have a problem with this 
film, the answer is quite 
simple and (metaphorical-
ly) staring you in the face.

Don’t see it.
Think of it as your ex-

ercising your right to pro-
test, another value that is 
most American.

STACEY MURRAY  Editor-in-Chief 

 
NICK HASSETT Opinions Editor

 MARCUS BROWN, JACOB PRALL, JOE LANE, JACK DUGAN
Editorial writers 

  CHRISTOPHER CERVANTES, JACE BRADY, SYDNEY NEWTON, 
HANNAH SOYER, SAM STUDER, KEITH REED, Columnists 

EDITORIALS reflect the majority opinion of the DI Editorial Board and not  the opinion of the 
Publisher, Student Publications Inc.,or the University of Iowa. 

OPINIONS, COMMENTARIES, COLUMNS, and EDITORIAL 
CARTOONS reflect the opinions of the authors and are not necessarily

those of the Editorial Board.

Pity the next 
president

EDITORIAL

Fine line of comedy in tragedy

President Obama must 
demand that Vice Presi-
dent Joe Biden immediate-
ly schedule a vote on Judge 
Merrick Garland’s nomina-
tion to the Supreme Court.

The U.S. Constitution 
makes Biden the presi-
dent of the Senate, and it 
provides for the election of 
powerless Senate officers. 
Biden, as did all his pre-
decessors, has delegated 
authority to various sub-
servient Senate officers. 

Obama, Biden, Speaker 
of the House Paul Ryan, 
and Chief Justice John 
Roberts are the only con-
stitutional executives of 
their respective domains 
who possess parallel do-
main authority.

Senate Majority Leader 
Mitch McConnell’s author-
ity is ordained by and at 
the pleasure of Biden. This 
subordinate office facili-
tates Senate operations.

A constitutional man-
date obligates Biden to 
intervene to ensure com-
pliance. Because no con-
stitutional amendment 

changed Biden’s Senate 
executive duties or author-
ity, he must process and 
arrange for the vote up or 
down on the nomination. 

The Senate GOP officers’ 
refusal transitions them in-
to a powerless ceremonial 
group. A senator’s only con-
stitutional mandate is to 
give advice and consent, not 
process nominee Garland. 

Sen. Charles Grassley, 
the chairman of the Sen-
ate Judiciary Committee, 
and the other elected 
GOP officers chose not to 
act as delegated by Biden. 
The senators can refuse, 
but Biden cannot.

Biden cannot accept 
or tolerate the refusal or 
interference by GOP sen-
ators. Therefore, using all 
Senate’s resources and 
powers, he must process 
and enforce.

Biden can delegate any 
executive authority to a sen-
ator or anyone at his plea-
sure without notice, consent, 
or advice, which he can re-
voke, restrict, strip, limit, or 
reassign without reason, no-

tice, consent, or advice.
Implicit in the president 

of the Senate’s power is 
the authority to ensure all 
constitutional mandates 
are fulfilled including del-
egated mandates. He can 
re-delegate at will any or 
all executive power of the 
Senate majority to the 
Senate minority or others.

Biden’s message must be 
unequivocal that conduct of 
blocking this constitutional 
mandate to advise and con-
sent is totally unacceptable 
and has consequences.

There is sufficient writ-
ten, audio, and video ev-
idence of GOP senators 
usurpation, contempt, lack 
of impartiality, conflict of 
interest, interference, and 
noncompliance justifying 
Biden to recuse them. 

Furthermore, Biden no-
tifies all current and future 
senators that he will dis-
pense sanctions provided 
by all the tools of his con-
stitutional executive office.

Biden can accept the cur-
rent duly elected Senate 
GOP officers as ceremonial 

and powerless because of 
malfeasance, thereby not 
requiring a new replace-
ment election.

Biden should retain or re-
assign his Senate executive 
authority to anyone, senator 
or not, who will adhere to 
the U.S. Constitution.

The GOP Senate officers 
attempted to stop a Senate 
constitutional mandate with 
total disdain, wanton disre-
gard, and foolishness, using 
threats and intimidation.

The new “Biden Three-
Part Rule” should be: 1) 
“No senator is above our 
Constitution”; 2) There is 
no selective process with 
“Shall”; 3) The options are 
vote up or down, not deny.

Biden’s assumption of 
control would state our 
Constitution is alive, well, 
and very active. If the 
GOP senators disagree, 
the only constitutional 
checks and balance pro-
vided for is resolution in 
the Supreme Court.

Vernon Weems is a 
retired attorney in Iowa.

VP Biden, do your other duties

COLUMN

GUEST OPINION

Jace Brady
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Christopher Cervantes
crvantes@uiowa.edu 



run in the bottom of the 
sixth to pull Iowa within 1.

Kansas State added a 
run in the seventh to move 
it to 3-1 before senior Tyler 
Peyton led off the eighth 
with a triple for Iowa. 
Moriel later brought him 
in with an RBI ground out 
to again pull Iowa within 1.

Iowa threatened again 
in the ninth when fresh-
man Luke Farley got a 
pinch-hit single with one 
out. Senior Corbin Woods, 
who pinch-ran for Farley, 
advanced to second on a 
failed pick-off attempt.

Sophomore Grant Kle-
novich struck out for the 
second out of the inning, 
and Peyton made his on-
ly out of the game, pop-
ping up to end it. Peyton 
was 4-for-5 with two dou-
bles and a triple.

After the April 30 
matchup was rained out, 
the Hawkeyes evened 
the series in the first 
game of the Sunday dou-
ble-header.

Hawkeye starter Ryan 
Erickson only lasted six 
outs for Iowa before he 
was lifted because of el-
bow tightness.

Sophomore Nick Gal-
lagher came in to re-
lieve Erickson and for 
the second weekend in a 
row was almost flawless 
out of the bullpen. He 
worked scoreless seven 
innings, allowing only 
2 hits with 5 strikeouts 
and no walks.

“I felt pretty good out 
there,” Gallagher said. 
“It was the first time in 
a while that I pitched 
in the cold weather, but 
I was throwing all my 
stuff for strikes, so that 
was a positive.”

Kansas State started 
the scoring in the top of 
the second off Erickson, 
with Tyler Wolfe roping 
a double to right-center 
field and later coming 
around on a Quintin 
Crandall RBI groundout.

Peyton got the run back 
for Iowa in the bottom half 
of the inning, scoring Far-
ley on an infield single.

After four-straight 
scoreless innings, senior 
Joel Booker hit a ball off 
the scoreboard in left field, 
damaging the video board, 
and putting the Hawkeyes 
ahead for good, 2-1.

“I was sitting off-speed, 
and he ended up hanging 

a slider,” Booker said.
The Wildcats took the 

rubber match Sunday af-
ternoon by a score of 4-2, 
taking advantage of a 
few key Hawkeye errors.

Kansas State used a 
sacrifice bunt and an 

RBI groundout to score 
Clayton Dalrymple, who 
led off the game with a 
double in the first.

The Wildcats tacked 
on runs in the fourth, 
sixth, and eighth to put 
Iowa away.

A pair of doubles in the 
third inning by Peyton and 
senior Nick Roscetti plat-
ed a run for Iowa in the 
third, and Roscetti drove 
in another on a single in 
the seventh for Iowa’s 2 

runs on the afternoon.
“We wanted to win 

this series, but it’s not a 
Big Ten series,” Roscetti 
said. “It was obviously 
important for us … but 
you have to look past it.”

good. I made other girls 
run my race because I 
was far ahead, and they 
couldn’t because I was 
too far ahead already.”

Iowa Director of Track 
and Field Joey Wood was 
pleased with not only 
Watts’s performance in 
the medley but also her 
800-meter victory.

“It’s great to see [Mahnee] 
gain some huge confidence 

and really believe that she 
can be one ofthe  compet-
itors in the 800 who can 
fight to win,” he said.

Besides the 800 and 
medley victories, Drake 
wasn’t the greatest per-
formance for the women.

Starting in the field 
events, Leah Colbert fin-
ished 21st (48.69 meters) 
in the hammer throw. 
Graduate student Khan-
ishah Williams finished 
12th in the high jump, 
and senior Dakotah 
Goodell took 10th place in 
the discus with a throw of 

47.29 meters, and Kayla 
Hochhalter finished 10th 
in the javelin.

Sophomore Jahisha 
Thomas wasn’t able to 
perform at her best, ei-
ther; she finished sev-
enth in long jump. On 
the track, Thomas took 
18th in the 110-meter 
hurdles and didn’t qual-
ify for the finals.

“Not great,” she said 
about her hurdle perfor-
mance. “It was rocky and 
rusty, my beginning run 
wasn’t great, and then it 
maintained. I just need 

to work on the first be-
ginning bit, and I need 
to more active going over 
the hurdles.”

Also underachieving 
was Holder in the 400-me-
ter hurdles. Coming into 
Drake, Holder was the 
favorite, ranking first in 
the Big Ten. However, she 
finished in fourth, while 
Purdue’s Symone Black 
captured the title.

Holder still owns the 
fastest time in the con-
ference; Woody believes 
she didn’t have the same 
type of rhythm she had in 

prior events.
“The 400 hurdles is a 

rhythm race,” he said. “I 
think sometimes you get 
caught up in the com-
petition sides of things, 
and we kind of lose the 
rhythm that we need 
to run. [Holder] is a lot 
faster than she’s ever 
been so, she’s just learn-
ing how to adapt.”

The struggles continued 
in the final event of the 
competition. The 1,600-me-
ter team of Guster, Briana 
Guillory, Alexis Hernan-
dez, and Holder finished 

third (3:34.63). Ohio State 
won (3:33.32) the event, and 
Texas took second (3:34.11).

Even with third, the 
squad members aren’t 
worried about where 
they stand.

“Right now, we still 
have the No. 1 time com-
ing into the Big Tens,” 
Guster said. “I mean, 
we didn’t have our best 
today, but we still ran 
fast. In all honesty, we’re 
not really worried about 
Ohio State. We know 
when Big Tens come, 
we’ll be ready.”
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WATTS
CONTINUED FROM 8

TRACK
CONTINUED FROM 8

BASEBALL
CONTINUED FROM 8

800-meter specialist Lil-
ly, who stretched Iowa’s 
lead on Illinois.

This past weekend 
marked the first time 
that Brissett and Harris 
got to run at Drake. Get-
ting a flag made it even 
more special.

“It was a great experi-
ence,” Harris said. “Peo-
ple were cheering for 
me, getting me hyped up. 
Just to go out there and 
win in front of the home 
crowd, get the flag, stand 
on the podium, it was re-
ally great.”

When the Lilly crossed 
the line, Iowa fans 
were on their feet; the 
Hawkeyes won by almost 
five seconds.

“We had a big leading 
coming in, when Mar’yea 

was bringing in the 
stick,” Lilly said. “I was 
just thinking that I had 
to go out, be relaxed, and 
don’t lose [the lead].”

Iowa’s 4x100 and 
4x400 did not move past 
the preliminaries. Also, 
the team did not field a 
4x200 relay.

James Harrington, a 
senior sprinter who is 
one of the fastest runners 
on the team, did not com-
pete at Drake. He pulled 
up after a race at the 
Musco Twilight on April 
23, and while his coaches 
noted that he was feeling 
good, they kept him out 
of competition to avoid 
aggravating anything.

The Hawkeyes who did 
advance to the finals per-
formed well despite the 
cold, windy, and rainy 
conditions but came up 
short nonetheless.

Saucer competed in the 
100 meters and finished 

the preliminaries with 
the second fastest time. 
In the finals, he finished 
third in 10.46 seconds.

Aaron Mallett finished 
third in the finals of the 
110-meter hurdles, clock-
ing a time of 13.58 seconds.

In the finals of the 400 
hurdles, Noah Larrison 
(51.37 seconds) finished 
0.33 seconds behind East-
ern Michigan’s Jeff Elam 
in a second-place effort.

“[Saturday] was fun be-
cause it was good to show 
what we are capable of 
in the sprints,” Iowa Di-
rector of Track and Field 
Joey Woody said. “After 
[April 29], we weren’t able 
to be in the battle, as we 
had expected to be, in the 
4x100 and the 4x400. We 
have to get some things 
figured out so that we are 
[in the battle] when we 
get to the Big Ten meet.”

The Hawkeyes have 
this coming weekend off, 

during which they can 
get some rest headed into 

the championship season.
Iowa will next compete 

on May 13 in the Big Ten 
outdoor meet.

Iowa freshman Noah Larrison moves toward the hurdles during the first half of the 400-meter hurdles at the Drake Relays on April 30. 
Larrison’s time of 51.37 placed him in second place. (The Daily Iowan/Brooklynn Kascel)



• Bake Sale for ELIMINATE, 10 a.m.-6 p.m., 
IMU Ground Floor
• Packing, Iowa New Play Festival Reading Series, 
1:30p.m., 172 Theater Building
• Just Living Planning Committee, with President 
Bruce Harreld, 4:30 p.m., Old Capitol Senate Chamber
• squeeze: A Motel Play, Iowa New Play Festival, 
5:30 & 9 p.m., Theater Building Theater B
• Ching-Wei Cho, piano, 6 p.m., University Capitol 
Center Recital Hall
 • Free Speech on College Campuses: A Public Forum, 
6:30 p.m., Prairie Lights, 15 S. Dubuque
• University Band/Concert Band, 7:30 p.m., IMU 
Second-Floor Ballroom

• Dan Laaveg, organ, 8 p.m., Riverside Recital Hall
• Matthew Mahaffey, saxophone, 8 p.m., University 
Capitol Center Recital Hall
• Ghyas Zeidieh, cello, 8 p.m., 172 Music West
• Rob Hillman, bassoon, 8 p.m., 150 Clinton Street Music 376

today’s events

the ledge
This column reflects the opinion of 
the author and not the DI Editorial 
Board, the Publisher, Student Publica-
tions Inc., or the University of Iowa.

Monday, May 2, 2016 
by Eugenia Lasthoroscopes
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Daily Break

Republican Aphorisms, 
Part 2

• All work and no play 
doesn’t mean that Jack needs 

to do something crazy like 
join a union.

• Share and share alike. 
WAIT, WHAT?

• I think, therefore I’m out of 
the party.

• You can take the boy out 
of the country club, but you 
can’t take the country club 

out of the boy.

• If you can’t beat ’em, 
stymie ’em.

• You can lead a horse to water, 
but you can’t make it medal in 

the Olympics.

• The best things in life are 
exceedingly expensive.

• When life gives you lemons, 
discard them immediately. 
Hire a guy to make mint 

juleps for you.

• All for one. (Me, preferably.)

• Politics does not make 
any kind of bedfellows. That 

would be gay.

• Time is money. Actually, now 
that you mention it, just about 

everything is money.

• A penny saved sounds like 
something a poor person 

would say.

• Fortune favors the fortunate.

Andrew R. Juhl thanks 
Will Hartman for the 

material in today’s Ledge.

The basic tool for the manipulation of reality is the manipulation of words.
— Philip K. Dick

KRUI  
     programming

MONDAY
8 A.M.-9 THE MORNING
9 NEWS AT NINE
11 THE LIT SHOW
12 P.M. NEWS AT NOON
1-2 OFF THE IVY
2-3 THE NFL
3-4 MISS JUNE’S GARAGE
4-5 MONDAY BS
5-6 NEWS AT FIVE
6-7 YEW PINEY MOUNTAIN
7-8 UNKNOWN ORIGIN
10-11 THE KGB
11-1 A.M. NIC @ NIGHT

ARIES (March 21-April 19): Temper your emotions to avoid a misun-
derstanding. Say “no” if you feel you are being taken for granted. Keep 
moving in a direction that encourages your success. Compromise more, 
criticize less. 
TAURUS (April 20-May 20): Be bold, and show off what you have to 
offer. Being consistent and dependable will ensure that you reach your 
goal. Be open to new ideas and an important partnership or learning 
experience will result. Romance is encouraged.
GEMINI (May 21-June 20): Be on your guard when it comes to helping 
others. You will be put in a compromising position or taken for granted 
if you are too accommodating. Keep your offers simple and focus on 
personal change. 
CANCER (June 21-July 22): Participate in functions that will help you ad-
vance your goals. Whether it’s finding love or working toward a higher or 
more interesting position, the results will be stellar. Think big and believe 
in yourself. Romance is in the stars. 
LEO (July 23-Aug. 22): Try to make positive changes. Get fit, or take part 
in activities that will inspire and motivate you to expand your interests, 
friendships, and prospects for the future. Don’t let an unfortunate con-
versation throw you off your game. 
VIRGO (Aug. 23-Sept. 22): Make travel plans, attend a conference, or en-
roll in a retreat that promises to help you deal with personal issues. Make 
romance a priority. Someone you respect will offer you good advice. Go 
out of your way to obtain valuable information. 
LIBRA (Sept. 23-Oct. 22): A good deal will be offered, but you may need 
to negotiate. You will discover benefits through the changes you initiate. 
A disciplined attitude should help you seal any deal that’s pending. Good 
fortune is within your reach. 
SCORPIO (Oct. 23-Nov. 21): Do your research, and assess your options. 
A chance to do things differently will spice up your life, encourage 
romance, and give you something to look forward to. Express your 
thoughts, and share your plans.
SAGITTARIUS (Nov. 22-Dec. 21): Problems will arise if you let your 
emotions take over or are too willing to act on secondhand information. 
It’s OK to bring about change as long as it won’t negatively affect others. 
Find a way to improve your position. 
CAPRICORN (Dec. 22-Jan. 19): A walk down memory lane will help you 
size up what needs to be done to improve your emotional, financial or 
personal needs. Speak up, and you will discover how to work with others 
to reach your goals. 
AQUARIUS (Jan. 20-Feb. 18): Express your ideas. Not everyone will 
agree with you, but once you identify who is willing to offer support, you 
will be able to move forward with confidence. Finding greater stability 
will give you a new lease on life.
PISCES (Feb. 19-March 20): Don’t leave anything to chance. Look over 
documents and important papers. Discuss what you want to do with 
someone you have worked with in the past or have known for a long 
time. An opportunity will come from inside sources.



THE DAILY IOWAN      DAILYIOWAN.COM     MONDAY, MAY 2, 2016 7



By ADAM HENSLEY | adam-hensley@uiowa.edu

DES MOINES — In the 107th 
Drake Relays, the Iowa men’s track 
and field team managed to claim just 
one flag.

The Hawkeyes (11 points) finished 
eighth, with Illinois (24 points) win-
ning the Relays.

Vinnie Saucer Jr., Christian Bris-
sett, Mar’yea Harris, and Carter Lil-
ly took home the lone victory for the 
Hawks in the medley.

The quartet beat Illinois (3:23.05) 
and Northern Iowa (3:24.34) with a 
time of 3:18.53.

“I just made sure I got a good start 

for my team,” Saucer said. “On the 
back stretch, I had a good push at 
the end, and I made sure I got the 
baton to Christian.”

Brissett snagged the handoff and 
took off, creating even more separa-
tion for the Hawkeyes.

The freshman credited the success 
to his teammates, especially Saucer.

“[Saucer] set me up really well,” 
he said. “I got it to Mar’yea, and [he] 
just killed it. Then Carter closed it 
out perfectly.” 

Harris ran the 400-meter section 
of the relay, then got the baton to 
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By BLAKE DOWSON
blake-dowson@uiowa.edu

The Iowa baseball 
team (20-21, 7-8 Big 
Ten) failed to get the 
bats going over a wet 
weekend, scoring 6 runs 
against Kansas State, 
dropping two of three 
against the Wildcats.

Neither team strung 
too many hits together 
in the series, with Kan-
sas State totaling only 8 
runs in three games. The 
Wildcats’ two victories 
came by a total of merely 
3 runs.

“The disappointing 
thing for me is I didn’t 
think we were very good 
offensively this entire 
weekend,” head coach 
Rick Heller said. “We 
only scored 6 runs this 
whole weekend. We have 
to be better than that. 
We can’t have that kind 

of pressure on our pitch-
ing staff.”

The Wildcats took the 
first game on April 29, 
3-2, behind a solid per-
formance from starter 
Parker Rigler. He went 
six innings, allowing on-
ly 1 run on 6 hits.

Sophomore C.J. Eldred 
took the loss for Iowa, 
moving his record to 2-6. 
Eldred went six innings 
allowing 2 runs, though 
only 1 was earned.

An error by Eldred 
as he was trying to 
cover first base on a 
play in the first inning 
allowed the Wildcats 
to score their first run, 
and that was ultimate-
ly the difference.

Senior Daniel Aaron 
Moriel had both of the 
Hawkeyes RBIs on April 
29, including a solo home 

Iowa baseball drops 2 of 3 as offense disappears

Drake grates on some Hawks 

Iowa center fielder Joel Booker collides with teammate Mitchell Boe during the third game of the Iowa-Kansas State series at Banks Field on Sunday. The 
Wildcats defeated the Hawkeyes, 4-2, to win two games of the three-game series. (The Daily Iowan/Margaret Kispert)

Iowa’s Mar‘yea Harris anchors the men’s 4x100 relay during the Drake Relays on April 29. Iowa took 10th place in the 
preliminaries. (The Daily Iowan/Brooklynn Kascel)

SEE BASEBALL, 5

SEE TRACK,5

Blythe sits all alone in NFL draft 
By JORDAN HANSEN
 jordan-hansen@uiowa.edu

It was a quiet NFL draft 
weekend for the Iowa 
football team; center Aus-
tin Blythe was the only 
Hawkeye player selected.

Indianapolis’ sev-
enth-round pick (248th 
overall), Blythe preserved 
what is now a 39-year 
streak of the Hawkeyes 
having at least one player 
drafted by an NFL team. 

“So blessed and lucky to 
have been picked by the 
Colts. Can’t wait to get start-
ed,” Blythe said on Twitter.

He won’t be the only 
former Hawkeye in the 

Colts’ training camp lat-
er this year. Wide receiv-
er Tevaun Smith signed a 
free-agent contract with 
Indianapolis after the 
draft and could compete 
for a spot on the roster.

If that doesn’t work 
out, he is also a top-rat-
ed Canadian Football 
League prospect.

“It’s all about getting an 
opportunity,” Smith said in 
a tweet. “Thank you, Colts.”

Tight end Henry Krieger 
Coble signed a free-agent 
contract with Broncos. The 
6-3, 248-pound prospect 
was invited to the Senior 
Bowl but went undrafted. 
He was signed quickly af-

ter the draft concluded.
Kicker Marshall Koehn 

and defensive back Jordan 

Lomax also went undrafted. 
The pair signed free-agent 
contracts with Miami and 
Los Angeles, respectively.

Koehn hit 16-of-20 field 
goals and 47-of-53 ex-
tra-point attempts last 

season. He should be in 
contention for a job, while 
Lomax will get a chance 
to make a mark on the 

freshly moved Rams.
“God has a plan for ev-

eryone; blessed to join the 
LA Rams organization,” 
Lomax wrote on Twitter.

Offensive lineman Jor-
dan Walsh and fullback 
Adam Cox both are head-
ed to Atlanta on free-
agent contracts.

The Chicago Bears al-
so decided to sign some 
local talent; defensive 
end Nate Meier and wide 
receiver Jacob Hillyer 
both reportedly received 
contracts from the team.

Running back Jordan 
Canzeri, who ranks 13th 
in Iowa history in rush-
ing, will have a free-agent 

tryout with the Kansas 
City Chiefs this weekend.

Defensive lineman Drew 
Ott went undrafted and as 
of Sunday evening had not 
been reported as having 
signed a free-agent contract. 
Ott tore his ACL in Iowa’s 
29-20 win over Illinois on 
Oct. 10 and was also dealing 
with an elbow injury.

Between his injuries 
and lack of tape from this 
season, NFL teams were 
obviously not entirely con-
vinced he was worth tak-
ing a chance on.

Linebacker Cole Fisher 
and punter Dillon Kidd also 
have yet to be reported as 
having signed on to a team.

Blythe
center

Smith
wide receiver

Krieger Coble
tight end

SERIES: KANSAS STATE 2, IOWA 1

By CONNOR SINDBERG | connor-sindberg@uiowa.edu
    
DES MOINES — Mahnee Watts 

stole the show at the rainy Drake Re-
lays on April 28-30.

The Bettendorf native won her 
first Drake title in the 800 meters 
and helped the women claim their 
second title in the 1,600-meter med-
ley. The two Drake titles highlighted 
a sixth-place finish (16 points) for 
the Hawkeyes.

Watts led the final leg on the win-
ning medley that included Lake 
Kwaza, Elexis Guster, and MonTay-
la Holder. The team finished with a 
time of 3:52.62, which ranks third on 

Iowa’s record list.
The race began with Kwaza jump-

ing out to a quick lead in the first leg. 
Guster then maintained the lead po-
sition in the second leg, and at the 
halfway mark, Holder kept the team 
in contention while handing the ba-
ton to Watts for the final 800 meters.

Watts pulled away in the final 200 
meters, with her strides similar to her 
winning the 800 meters on April 29.

“I just executed the race like my 
coaches told me to,” Watts said. “I 
just ran a really smart race; the time 
wasn’t fast, but the execution was 

SEE WATTS,5

Iowa’s Mahnee Watts crosses the finish line in first place during the 800 meters at theDrake Relays on April 29. Watts 
won with a time of 2:07.93 and took home her first Drake flag. (The Daily Iowan/Brooklynn Kascel)
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